Purchasing Department

Madison County Board of Supervisors
146 West Center Street
Canton, Mississippi 39046

601-855-5503
hardy@madison-co.com

27 February 2015

District 1 Supervisor John Bell Crosby
District 2 Supervisor John Howland
District 3 Supervisor Gerald Steen
District 4 Supervisor Karl Banks
District 5 Supervisor Paul Griffin

Subject: Award Asphalt and Asphalt-Related Term Bids for Period 1 April 2015 -
30 Sept 2015

Gentlemen:

Attached are copies of recently-opened Asphalt and Asphalt-Related Term Bids for the
six-month period 1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015.

A few notes of interest:

1. SC 1 Type II Asphalt price dropped from $61.40 per ton to $57.50 per ton
2. Liquid Asphalt price dropped from $2.29 per gallon to $2.10 per gallon
3. The price for Laying Asphalt dropped from $12 per ton to $11.24 per ton

I recommend that the Board take the following action:

1. Award the Term Bid for SC-1 TYPE Il ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2015
— 30 September 2015 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton’s price for SC-1 TYPE II of $57.50 is higher than two
other bidders; however, the round-trip haul distance to the other bidders’
plants is much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and
dump-truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to
pick-up a ton of SC 1 Type II Asphalt from APAC-Canton is $57.81
compared to $60.80 from the next lowest bidder, APAC-Jackson, making
APAC-Canton the “lowest and best bid.” The cost per ton picked up is even
greater from Dickerson & Bowen and ADCAMP. Detailed calculations are
attached and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

2. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type I ASPAHLT for the
period 1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to APAC-Jackson.

3. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 Type II ASPAHLT for the
period 1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to Dickerson & Bowen.



10.

Award the Term Bid for SC-1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2015
— 30 September 2015 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton’s price for SC-1 TYPE 8 of $61 is higher than two other
bidders; however, the round-trip haul distance to the other bidders’ plants is
much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and tires and dump-
truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total cost to pick-up a
ton of SC 1 TYPE 8 Asphalt from APAC-Canton is $61.31 compared to
$63.12 from the next lowest bidder, Dickerson & Bowen, making APAC-
Canton the “lowest and best bid.” The cost per ton picked up is even greater
from APAC-Jackson. Detailed calculations are attached and incorporated as
part of this letter by reference.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 TYPE 8 ASPAHLT for the
period 1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to Dickerson & Bowen.

Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for SC-1 TYPE 8 ASPAHLT for the
period 1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to APAC-Jackson.

Award the Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2015 — 30
September 2015 to APAC-CANTON.

Note: APAC-Canton’s price for BB-1 Asphalt of $51.35 is higher than
APAC-Jackson’s bid; however, the round-trip haul distance to APAC-
Jackson’s plant is much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and
tires and dump-truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total
cost to pick-up a ton of BB-1 Asphalt from APAC-Canton is $51.66 compared
to $56.80 from APAC-Jackson, making APAC-Canton the “lowest and best
bid.” Detailed calculations are attached and incorporated as part of this letter
by reference.

Award the First Alternate Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1
April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to Dickerson & Bowen.

Note: Dickerson & Bowen’s price for BB-1 Asphalt of $51.50 is higher than
APAC-Jackson’s bid; however, the round-trip haul distance to APAC-
Jackson’s plant is much greater. When fuel cost, driver pay and benefits, and
tires and dump-truck maintenance are calculated into the equation, the total
cost to pick-up a ton of BB-1 Asphalt from Dickerson & Bowen is $56.62
compared to $56.80 from APAC-Jackson, making Dickerson & Bowen the
“lowest and best” First Alternate Term Bid. Detailed calculations are attached
and incorporated as part of this letter by reference.

Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for BB 1 ASPHALT for the period 1
April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to APAC-JACKSON.

Award the Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT for the period
1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to ADCAMP.



11.  Award the First Alternate Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING
ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to Hancock.

12. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for HAULING AND LAYING
ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to APAC-
Canton.

13.  Reject Dickerson & Bowen’s bid for HAULING AND LAYING ASPHALT
for the period 1 April 2015 — 30 September 2015 due to the company’s failure
to meet the specifications. The company did not bid on hauling and laying
asphalt from the county’s selected asphalt vendor as required by the
specifications.

14.  Award the Term Bid for LIQUID ASPHALT for the period 1 April 2015 —30
September 2015 to ERGON.

15.  Award the First Alternate Term Bid for LIQUID ASPHALT for the period 1
April 2015 — 30 September 2015 to Blackledge.

16.  Award the Term Bid for COLD MIX for the period 1 April 2015 — 30
September 2015 to Dickerson & Bowen.

17.  Award the First Alternate Term Bid for COLD MIX for the period 1 April
2015 — 30 September 2015 to APAC-Jackson.

18.  Award the Term Bid for ROAD RECLAMATION (All Depths) for the period
1 April 2015 — 30 September 15 to ADCAMP.

19.  Award the Term Bid for COLD MILLING for the period 1 April 2015 —30
September 15 to ADCAMP.

20.  Award the Term Bid for ROAD BASE REPAIRS for the period 1 April 2015
— 30 September 15 to ADCAMP.

ADCAMP’s bid of $85 per square yard for Road Base repairs is greater than
APAC’s bid of $59 per square yard; however, APAC’s bid stipulated a
minimum of 500 square yards. A minimum was not part of the specifications.
Warnock Engineering construction supervisor Jimmy Vickers stated that he
does not anticipate Madison County ever undertaking 500 square yards of
base repairs that is not part of a separately bid road construction job.

Thank you in advance for your consideration of the above recommendations

Sincerely,

ardy
Purchase Clerk



ASPHALT TABULATION FOR 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPT 2015

Terry May Terry May Don Gleen Ralph Barnes
0: 376-4000 O: 376-4000 0: 346-7368 O: 939-4493
F: 376-4055  F: 376-4055 F: 346-7152  C: 940-1343

john.may@apac.com dongleen@ ralph@
bellsouth.net adcampinc.com
SC 1 TYPE Il PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT ADCAMP
Rankin
Miles to Road Department 30
SC 1 Type Il Asphalt $58.25
Round Trip Miles 3 56.4 49.8 60
X $1.44 Per Mile Freight Cost $4.32 $81.22 $71.71 $86.40
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up $0.31 $5.80 $5.12 $6.17
Cost per ton picked-up $57.81 $60.80 $61.12 $64.42
SC 1 TYPE 8 PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT ADCAMP
Rankin
Miles to Road Department 30
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt $61.25
Round Trip Miles 3 56.4 49.8 60
X $1.44 Per Mile Freight Cost $4.32 $81.22 $71.71 $86.40
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up $0.31 $5.80 $5.12 $6.17
Cost per ton picked-up $61.31 $64.80 $63.12 $67.42
BB 1 PICKED UP BY ROAD DEPT ADCAMP
Rankin
Miles to Road Department 29
BB 1 ASPHALT $54.00
Round Trip Miles 3 56.4 49.8 60
X $1.44 Per Mile Freight Cost $4.32 $81.22 $71.71 $86.40
Freight Cost Per Ton to Pick-Up $0.31 $5.80 $5.12 $6.17

Cost per ton picked-up $51.66 $56.80 $56.62 $60.17



HAULING & LAYING ASPHALT APAC Dickerson

JACKSON Jackson

LAYING NO BID $12.00
HAULING 0.25 $0.20
$3 MIN THEIR ASPHALT
REJECT
COLD MIX

LIQUID ASPHALT
CRS-2

ROAD RECLAMATION ADCAMP

4 Inches
8 Inches
12 Inches
18 Inches
24 Inches

APAC JAX
ROAD BASE REPAIRS (10 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD $59.00
500 SQ YD MIN

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS) PER SQ YD -




ESTIMATE OF COSTS PER MILE TO OPERATE DUMP TRUCKS
FOR THE PERIOD 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPT 2015

AVERAGE MPG FOR DUMP TRUCK 4.2625
DIESEL PRICE PER GALLON $2.17
DIESEL COST PER MILE $0.51
OTHER COSTS PER MILE (TIRES, REPAIRS, ETC) $0.18
TOTAL TRUCK COST PER MILE $0.69
AVERAGE DRIVER WAGES & BENEFITS $22.39
AVERAGE MILES DRIVEN PER HOUR 30
DRIVER COST PER MILE $0.75
TOTAL COST PER MILE $1.44

Notes: Diesel price is based upon most recent Fuelman bill
Driver wages and benefits based upon cost figures from Human Resources Director
"Other Costs" is based upon purchase orders issued for tires, repairs, parts, etc.

HARDY CRUNK, PURCHASE CLERK



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
AMENDED SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2015

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 24 FEBRUARY 2015

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt Jj 72X per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt Jfé/ %Z per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt 5 | > Z per ton
Cold Mix —~NA - per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered ~NHA —  pergallon

AN of the clbove mdesd T Fop ACAC's Quudom Ms pku}l

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid Hauling & Laying of Asphalt is for selected road projects to be undertaken
by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a
contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a
specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen

asphalt vendor(s). 2
Hauling /% % /’% f“ per ton—mﬂe/]/w\
Laying ‘)ﬁ |7 'ﬁo per ton 3¢ o A -

{v/




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth I/ A per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth ﬂ) B per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth V& per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth ﬁ) A per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth f\) B per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon ‘ N »A - .
Per Linear Foot .l n/ A -
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of ten inches and replace with base asphalt

H g0
Per Square Yard 56‘ S ,5% ~4\cj

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard 3&4_5?0@ A -\500%5% U

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 1.5 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said



4 product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: _AHC. —ﬂ%%ﬁf@?:\/ ue.
ADDRESS: 1.0, Boy ZASDE

oo Mo 592254508
TELEPHONE: led - 87L- 4000
CELL PHONE NUMBER: __ 60 (- 954-87bl,
FAXNUMBER: (90 |- 37l- 40565
EMAIL: JO\/\ n.inay @ apal-Con

Ty 2/t~ 25
AUTHORIZED/REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

/
JERRY MY
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
AMENDED SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2015

ALL BIDS DUE 10 AM. 24 FEBRUARY 2015

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

0.2
SC 1 Type II Asphalt ‘%\ (6_5 per ton

: 60
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt 26 5C\ - per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

c0
BB 1 Asphalt ga A1~ perton
B 0 22

Cold Mix /0 X¢ perton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered - NA - per gallon

N
”T’\(\e oove Mer\q\ No Yol APAC'S QO‘L\(BM /(,Qb Pla&éc\bfc_qmm
Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid Hauling & Laying of Asphalt is for selected road projects to be undertaken

by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a

contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a
- specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

(v) ) A
Hauling z %60/) 3, , 'm per ton-mile T%"

Laying - per ton
— NA




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth . N per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth N A per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth '\) A per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth N yA per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth N \A per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon N W
Per Linear Foot N &
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of ten inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard NA

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard | N A

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 28.2 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said



~ product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: /M—///ﬁﬁxﬁ/é;}eﬁ/; 4.
ADDRESS: /0. fox ZAD8

e Mo Siz25 498
TELEPHONE: Ok 37b- 4000
CELL PHONENUMBER: (o0 |- 954-576 ¢
FAX NUMBER: bol- BTb- 4655

EMAIL: ;J\O\/\v\. mey @ CfuC.Cold
L, 2-/4-2215
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

(V. tey

PRINTED AUTHORIZED RFPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
AMENDED SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2015

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 24 FEBRUARY 2015

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt #56,. i per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt Bos o2 per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt 85,52 per ton
Cold Mix Fg5. 0 per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered #o Bid  per gallon

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid Hauling & Laying of Asphalt is for selected road projects to be undertaken
by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a
contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a
specific road construction project.

Pidders Aspunlt plaut
Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s deswsaated-asphal=vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly te-ts=ehesen Bidder

asphetendexs).

&
0.%°

Hauling per ton-mile

ﬂ\z.O—"

Laying per ton




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth Mo Bid per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth o Bid per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth o Brd per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth o Bid per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth wh Bid per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon Ao Bird
Per Linear Foot o Bid
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of ten inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard "/40' o OO Sy mivimam per Ropnir

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard who Brd

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 24.9 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said



product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:  Dickersod £ Boweo Dec.

ADDRESS: .0, Box toog

Biecoldypves, Ms. 390

TELEPHONE: (Got) g49-zoco2

CELL PHONE NUMBER: (¢o!) s40-5 005

FAX NUMBER: (Coi) 3¢9- zood

EMAIL: ¥ (OAJqéime A;IISOuIL enlef

/ /q/\ | 2/zd/ls

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

Dou L. Cleww ARer tumnrger

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE '



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
AMENDED SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2015

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 24 FEBRUARY 2015

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt $38.25 per ton
SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt $61.25 per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications) -

BB 1 Asphalt $54.00 per ton
Cold Mix NO BID per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered NO BID per gallon

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid Hauling & Laying of Asphalt is for selected road projects to be undertaken
by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a
contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a
specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and

hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling $0.25 per ton-mile
(MINIMUM OF $3.00 HAUL)
Laying $11.24 per ton




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth $25.00 per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth $28.00 per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth $30.00 per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth $35.00 per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth $38.00 per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon NO BID
Per Linear Foot NO BID
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of ten inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard $85.00

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard $2.50

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: 30 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said



product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: _ ADCAMP, ,INC.

PHYSICAL

ADDRESS: 1353 FLOWOOD DR., FLOWOOD, MS 39232
MAILING ADDRESS: P. 0. BOX 54246, JACKSON, MS 39288-4246
TELEPHONE: 601-949-4493

CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-940-1343 (RALPH BARNES)

FAX NUMBER: 601-939-4676

EMAIL: ralph@adcampinc.com

ébzu’r"z\ AW 02/24/2015
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

RALPH BARNES, PRESIDENT

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



W.S. "RED" HANCOCK, INC.
MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

AMENDED SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2015

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 24 FEBRUARY 2015

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt ‘ per ton

SC 1 Type 8 Asphalt \ \ per ton
(Per 1990 MDOT specifications)

BB 1 Asphalt \t\ j\ Y)( per ton

‘ A\J
Cold Mix | \ per ton

CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered per gallon

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid Hauling & Laying of Asphalt is for selected road projects to be undertaken
by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a
contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a
specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling .25 per ton-mile

Laying 11.98 per ton




WS RED HANCOCK, INC.

ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth per square yard

A
8 (eight) inch depth ] \ per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth \1\\// M per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth V per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon

1
Per Linear Foot A / / /A

ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of ten inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: _ 1.4 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said



product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price
for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: W.S. "RED" HANCOCK, INC. | 207979

ADDRESS: P.0. BOX 207

BENTONIA-MS. 39040

TELEPHONE: 662-755-2253

CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-209-3278

FAX NUMBER: 662-755-8681

EMAIL: REDHANCOCK@BELLSOUTH.NET

/K%L 2-23-2015

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

?04 €& %//V%K 223/ bam

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2015

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 24 FEBRUARY 2015

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt NO BID per ton
BB 1 Asphalt NO BID per ton
Cold Mix NOBID per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered $2.10" per gallon

**Pricing based on delivery of full truck transport quantities to any location within the county.
Demurrage: 2 hours free - $75/hr thereatfter.
Federal Environmental Fee will be added to above price at a rate of $0.00133/gal for all emulsion loads.

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid Hauling & Laying of Asphalt is for selected road projects to be undertaken
by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a
contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a
specific road construction project. '

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen

asphalt vendor(s).
Hauling N/A per ton-mile
Laying N/A per ton

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth N/A per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth N/A per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth N/A per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth N/A per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth N/A per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon N/A
Per Linear Foot N/A
ROAD BASE REPAIRS

Dig out road to depth of ten inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard N/A
COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)
Per Square Yard N/A

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: _approximately 65 Miles

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.




for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.

ADDRESS: P. O. Box 23028

Jackson, MS 39232-3028

TELEPHONE: (601) 933-3000

CELL PHONE NUMBER:  (601) 497-7278 - Amy L. Walker, Area Sales Manager

FAX NUMBER: (601) 933-3363
EMAIL: Amy.Walker@ergon.com

AM\ 0Q' (;OOL,U?/UL) February 24, 2015
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

Amy L. Walker, Area Sales Manager
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

ASPHALT AND ASPHALT-RELATED PRODUCTS AND SERVICES
TERM BID FOR PERIOD 1 APRIL 2015 - 30 SEPTEMBER 2015

ALL BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 24 FEBRUARY 2015

MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY CLERK’S OFFICE
MADISON COUNTY CHANCERY COURTHOUSE
ROOMS 225-227, SECOND FLOOR
146 WEST CENTER STREET
CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 39046

BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON COUNTY-
FURNISHED BID SHEET—NO EXCEPTIONS

SC 1 Type II Asphalt per ton
BB 1 Asphalt per ton
Cold Mix per ton
CRS2 Liquid Asphalt Delivered %72.19 per gallon DRLINVERED

Hauling and Laying Asphalt

The term bid Hauling & Laying of Asphalt is for selected road projects to be undertaken
by Madison County. It does not apply to advertised road construction projects in which a
contractor is purchasing, hauling, and laying asphalt as part of a board-awarded bid for a
specific road construction project.

Asphalt shall be picked-up by bidder from county’s designated asphalt vendor(s) and
hauled to job site for lay-down by bidder. Haul mileage will be paid for distance from
asphalt plant(s) to job site. All asphalt will be paid for by county directly to its chosen
asphalt vendor(s).

Hauling per ton-mile

Laying per ton




ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be pre square yard)

4 (four) inch depth per square yard
8 (eight) inch depth per square yard
12 (twelve) inch depth per square yard
18 (eighteen) inch depth per square yard
24 (twenty-four) inch depth per square yard

BITUMINOUS CRACK SEALER APPLIED BY CONTRACTOR
(Pay Item will be County’s choice of Per Gallon or Per Linear Foot)

Per Gallon

Per Linear Foot

ROAD BASE REPAIRS
Dig out road to depth of ten inches and replace with base asphalt

Per Square Yard

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)

Per Square Yard

For use in our calculation of Lowest and Best Bid, note here the
Number of Miles from Your Company Plant/Storage Facility to the
Madison County Road Department: ___ L% Miles MOBILE P - PLANA

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the
Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the products and/or
services on this Specifications and Bid Sheet that it will provide said
product(s) and/or service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price



for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further
agrees that it will not dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each
specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that in the
event that it does dispense and/or deliver quantities of a product and/or
service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for a
specific order or orders, that that it will neither bill nor hold Madison County
responsible for the quantity of such product and/or service that exceeds the
purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: BLACKLDGE. BMWVSIONS, INC .

ADDRESS: 11591 BiegNxed PMewny gl 200

LULERDRL  MS 2A%02

TELEPHONE: 400 -dule- 2919 V100032018

CELL PHONE NUMBER: (/0| - W4. 43714

FAX NUMBER:_ 721%. 34- 0437

EMAIL:_ \r wood D be -inc. cons

/Y(\ \f\/o\v/ 2119

AUTHOR@ZED REPRESENTATIVE’S SIGNATURE DATE

J 2. WooD
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE’S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN
AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE



